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the same and shall have full power and authority to sell
alien charge or otherwise dispose of any real or personal
property so to be by them acquired as aforesaid and to act
and do in all things relating to the said Corporation in as
ample manner and form as any other our liege subjects
being persons able and capable in the law or any other

body politic or corporate in our said United Kingdom of
Great Britain and Ireland may or can act or do And We
do hereby declare and grant that the number of Fellows
of the said Society shall be indefinite and that they the
said William Buckland Arthur Aikin John Bostock George
Bellas Greenough and Henry Warburton shall be the first
Fellows of the said Society and that any three or more of
them shall and may on or before the Third Friday in

February next ensuing the date of these Presents under
their respective hands in writing appoint such other

persons to be Fellows and foreign Members of the said

Society as are willing to be appointed and as they may
think fit And We do further declare and grant That for
the better government of the said Society and for the
better management of the Concerns thereof there shall be
from the date of these Presents thenceforth and for ever a

President and Council of the said Society and that such
Council whereof the President shall be deemed a Member

shall from the date of these Presents until the third Friday
in February next ensuing consist of five Members and

from the said third Friday in February thenceforth and for

ever shall consist of twenty three Members And We do

hereby appoint the said William Buckland to be first

President and the said William Buckland together with
the said Arthur Aikin John Bostock George Bellas

Greenough and Henry Warburton to be the first Council
all and each of the aforesaid Persons to continue in such
their respective offices until the third Friday in February
next ensuing the date of these Presents And We further
direct that the Fellows of the said Society or any eleven
or more of them shall and may on the said third Friday in

February next ensuing and also shall and may on the
third Friday in February or as near thereto as conveniently

may be in every succeeding Year assemble together at the
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